POSTAL AUCTION BID SHEET (cartophilic Society of NZ Inc.)

POSTAL AUCTION: No.169 CLOSING DATE: Friday 13 June 2008. NB Please try to list Lot No’s in numerical order.
AUCTIONEER:  Maurice Eder, 51 Ashbys Road, Balcairn, RD1, Amberley 8251, North Canterbury; NZ; ph (03) 312 9885.

LOTNO | BID LOT NO BID LOT NO BID LOT NO BID LOT NO BID

I do not wish my successful bids to exceed $........... Membership No.  ........... (NB you must be a financial member to bid.)
NBMIE: ... e AAIESS: o

Method of paying (tick): Cheque; __;  Credit Card: - Type: Mastercard: ___or VISA ___ please complete details:
Card Number: ... i s e Name on Card: ......cccccceevevennne, Expiry Date: ...../[..... Signature:..............

Postal Auction Sale Rules

All lots are offered for sale without Reserve unless otherwise stated.

The highest bidder shall be the purchaser. Where 2 or more bids for same amount, the bid RECEIVED will be the buyer.
Bids to be in the following increments: up to $50 ...50 cent increments; over $50 ... $1.00 increments.

Lots to be sold to the highest bidder - one step above the second highest bidder.

Should only one bid be received for a lot, and that bid is above the estimate, it will be sold at the estimate, or at the amount
of the bid if below the estimate - subject to any reserve.

Bids less than 2/3™ estimate will not be accepted.

Postage costs are payable by the purchaser.

Overseas lots will be sent Air Mail unless indicated otherwise on the bid sheet.

Payment should be made within 7 days of receiving the account.

10 There will be a small surcharge (about 5%) for people paying by credit card. (new rule came into effect as at 21 Apr 2007)
11 Email bids are currently not acceptable so all postal bids must be used on this form & posted directly to the auctioneer.
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PRICES REALISED "POSTAL AUCTION 168" (Feb 2008)

LOT | BID$ | LOT | BID$ | LOT | BID$ | LOT | BID$ | LOT | BID$ | LOT | BID$ | LOT | BID$ | LOT | BID$
7 2.00 | 47 9.00 | 91 |1250 ] 116 3.50 | 167 8.00 | 214 20.50 | 281 5.00 | 321 7.00
8 2.00 | 48 5.00 | 92 |18.00 | 118 5.00 | 170 5.00 | 215 33.50 | 286 | 12.00 | 324 5.00
10 | 10.00 51 3.00 | 93 | 20.00| 119 | 34.00 | 171 | 20.00 | 216 25.50 | 287 | 15.00 | 327 3.00
11 | 20.00 55 1000 | 94 | 2150 | 120 | 1250 | 172 | 30.00 | 217 15.50 | 288 | 15.00 | 328 | 18.50
13 17.00 60 500 | 95 | 2150 | 135 750 | 174 | 30.00 | 218 33.50 | 290a | 2.00 | 331 | 10.00
19 16.00 66 9.00 | 96 19.50 | 137 5.50 | 176 2.00 | 219 25.50 | 290b 2.00 | 332 | 28.50
21 | 40.00 67 *8.00 | 97 12.50 | 138 8.50 | 178 3.00 | 220 20.50 | 292 6.00 | 335 9.00
22 10.00 69 *5.00 | 98 10.50 | 139 5,50 | 179 | 15.00 | 249 15.00 | 293 | 10.00 | 336 | 15.00
23 1550 | 70 550 | 99 | 20.50 | 141 2.00 | 180 3.00 | 250 7.00 | 295 | 12.00 | 338 7.50
24 | 25.50 77 5.00 | 100 | 21.50 | 145 3.50 | 181 3.00 | 251 7.00 | 296 8.00 | 339 5.00
25 10.50 78 4.00 | 101 | 15.00 | 148 9.00 | 185 | 10.00 | 252 7.00 | 297 | 25.00 | 340 3.50
27 12.00 79 4.00 | 102 | 10.00 | 149 3.00 | 188 3.00 | 253 7.00 | 301 8.00
31 8.00 80 2.00 | 103 | 10.00 | 150 7.00 | 200 2.00 | 254 6.00 | 302 | 45.00
34 10.00 81 6.00 | 104 3.00 | 153 | 20.00 | 202 | 10.00 | 255 6.00 | 306 6.00
36 2.00 83 150 | 105 | 15.00 | 154 5.00 | 205 3.00 | 264 15.00 | 307 2.00
38 2.00 84 20.50 | 107 | 10.00 | 160 5.00 | 209 6.00 | 265 1.50 | 309 6.00
39 2.00 85 4.00 | 112 | 13.00 | 161 | 46.00 | 210 | 6.00 | 267 17.00 | 313 2.00
42 6.00 86 2.00 | 113 6.50 | 163 4.00 | 211 | 18.50 | 269 5.00 | 317 3.00
44 2.00 89 17.00 | 114 | 12.00 | 164 | 12.00 | 212 | 38.00 | 272 20.00 | 318 2.00
46 3.50 90 50.00 | 115 WD | 166 | 10.50 | 213 | 45.00 | 278 5.00 | 320 8.00

KEY: US = Unsold; WD Withdrawn; * tied bid; most bids: 5 for lots 213, 215, 220; bid sheets rec: 25; total lots sold: 149/339 = 43.9%.
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