
POSTAL AUCTION BID SHEET (Cartophilic Society of NZ Inc.) 
 

POSTAL AUCTION:  No. 174 CLOSING DATE: Friday 18 September 2009.   

AUCTIONEER: (CONTACT DETAILS ONLY AVAILABLE TO FINANCIAL MEMBERS). 

 

NB Please try to list Lot No’s in numerical order. 

LOT NO BID LOT NO BID LOT NO BID LOT NO BID LOT NO BID 

          

          

          

          

          

          

          

 

I do not wish my successful bids to exceed $........… Membership No. ........... (NB You must be a financial member to bid.) 

 

Name: ............................................................……  Address: ............................................................... 

                  ............................................................... 

Method of paying (tick): Cheque; ___; Credit Card: ____ - Type: Mastercard: ___ or VISA ___ please complete details: 

 

Card Number: ........   ............    ..........    ......... Name on Card: ......................... Expiry Date: ...../..... Signature:.....……… 

 

Postal Auction Sale Rules 
1 All lots are offered for sale without Reserve unless otherwise stated. 

2 The highest bidder shall be the purchaser. Where 2 or more bids for same amount, the FIRST bid received will be the buyer. 

3 Bids to be in the following increments: up to $50 …50 cent increments; over  $50 … $1.00 increments. 

4 Lots to be sold to the highest bidder - one step above the second highest bidder. 

5 Should only one bid be received for a lot, and that bid is above the estimate, it will be sold at the estimate, or at the amount 

of the bid if below the estimate - subject to any reserve. 

6 Bids less than 2/3
rds

 estimate will not be accepted (multiply Estimate by 0.66 to get minimum bid price.) 

7 Postage/Packing costs are payable by the purchaser. 

8 Overseas lots will be sent Air Mail unless indicated otherwise on the bid sheet. 

9 Payment should be made within 7 days of receiving the account. 

10 A surcharge of 5% will be made for people paying by credit card no matter what value of transaction.  

11 Email bids are currently not acceptable so all postal bids must be used on this form and posted directly to the auctioneer. 

13 The Cartophilic Society of NZ Inc will endeavour to ensure that all aspects of the auction procedure are thorough. However, 

the Society will not be liable for any errors or omissions in executing vendors or purchasers instructions or for any late or non-

receipt of material or bids. 

- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 

PRICES REALISED "POSTAL AUCTION 173" (May 2009) 

LOT BID$ LOT BID$ LOT BID$ LOT BID$ LOT BID$ LOT BID$ LOT BID$ LOT BID$ 

1 52.00 29 15.50 74 9.50 107 *12.50 139 12.00 185 10.00 227 40.00 287 30.00 

2 61.00 30 4.50 75 5.00 108 *12.50 148 6.00 197 8.00 228 6.00 288 5.00 

3 9.00 33 7.50 76 *38.00 109 9.00 151 3.00 199 30.00 233 10.00 289 5.00 

4 10.00 39 2.00 78 30.50 110 5.00 158 3.00 200 45.00 236 3.00 290 24.00 

6 38.00 40 2.00 79 5.50 114 3.00 160 4.00 201 350.00 238 12.00 291 30.00 

7 30.50 41 28.00 84 15.00 117 3.00 161 1.50 202 72.00 240 2.00 293 5.00 

8 25.00 46 15.00 85 37.00 120 3.50 162 1.50 212 2.00 243 4.50 294 9.00 

9 6.00 53 20.00 86 20.00 121 5.00 169 10.00 213 *20.00 244 27.50 295 5.00 

10 15.00 54 5.50 87 32.50 126 30.00 170 3.00 214 10.00 245 23.50 296 2.00 

11 20.00 55 10.00 88 10.00 127 4.00 171 6.00 216 9.00 251 3.00 300 10.00 

12 18.00 56 3.50 89 15.50 128 3.50 177a *4.00 217 24.00 253 3.00 301 15.00 

14 13.00 57 15.00 90 20.00 129 20.00 177b *4.00 219 30.00 255 3.50 302 10.00 

15 85.00 67 9.00 91 20.00 130 1.50 178 3.00 221 2.00 256 3.50 303 12.00 

24 7.50 69 *10.00 97 15.00 131 4.00 179 12.00 222 7.50 262 5.50 304 4.00 

25 7.00 70 23.50 100 110.00 132 3.50 180 150.00 223 24.00 264 3.00 305 4.50 

26 5.00 72 15.00 102 7.00 135 7.50 181 15.50 224 24.00 270 30.00 306 7.00 

28 4.50 73 28.50 106 5.00 137 *6.00 182 4.00 226 *10.00 285 5.00     

KEY: US = Unsold; WD Withdrawn; * tied bid; most bids: 5 for 7 & 73; bid sheets received: 34; total lots sold: 134/306 = 43.8% 


